
 

 

 

 

Appreciations Friday 10 November 2023 

Year 7 

Miss E Sandland would like to appreciate Glory A for outstanding effort in Geography. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Khaqan A for excellent determination and effort in geography. 

Miss S Ambrose would like to appreciate Khaqan A for fantastic work and effort in History and DEAR sessions. 

Mrs S Russell would like to appreciate Abiha A for excellent effort in geography. 

Mr J Walshaw would like to appreciate Archie A for their hard work and excellent application in PE. Well done. 

Mr A Gallagher would like to appreciate Macy B for excellent effort in Computer Science. 

Mr R Al-Ghailani would like to appreciate Logan B for always being helpful in class and in and around the school. 

Miss E Sandland would like to appreciate Reuben B for outstanding effort in Geography. 

Mrs S Russell would like to appreciate Kieron C for excellent effort in geography. 

Mrs R Lewis would like to appreciate Oliver C for amazing effort in science. 

Mrs R Lewis would like to appreciate Devika D for excellent effort in science. 

Mr J Walshaw would like to appreciate Abdelmohaimen E for their hard work and excellent application in PE. Well 
done. 

Mr J Walshaw would like to appreciate Wisdom E for their hard work and excellent application in PE. Well done. 

Miss E Sandland would like to appreciate Olivia F for outstanding effort in Geography. 

Mrs R Lewis would like to appreciate Jesse-James H for excellent effort in science. 

Miss E Sandland would like to appreciate Isla-May H for outstanding effort in Geography. 

Miss E Sandland would like to appreciate Rafael H for outstanding effort in Geography. 

Mrs R Lewis would like to appreciate Sethuli J for excellent effort in science. 

Miss E Sandland would like to appreciate Sethuli J for outstanding effort in Geography. 

Mrs R Lewis would like to appreciate Daisy J for excellent effort in science. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Rithika K for excellent determination and effort in geography. 

Mr A Gallagher would like to appreciate Isabella K for excellent effort in Computer Science. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Harper L for excellent determination and effort in geography. 

Mr A Gallagher would like to appreciate Harvey L for excellent effort in Computer Science. 

Mr A Gallagher would like to appreciate Jayden M for excellent effort in Computer Science. 

Mr J Walshaw would like to appreciate Sonny M for their hard work and excellent application in PE. Well done. 

Mr A Gallagher would like to appreciate Jaynie M for excellent effort in Computer Science. 

Mr A Gallagher would like to appreciate Nathan M for excellent effort in Computer Science. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Jack O for excellent determination and effort in geography. 

Miss S Foley would like to appreciate Bella P for showing determination to succeed in Spanish lessons. 

Mr A Gallagher would like to appreciate Owen Q for excellent effort in Computer Science. 

Miss S Ambrose would like to appreciate Thomas S for a great first week in a new advisory group. 

Mr A Gallagher would like to appreciate Isabella S for excellent effort in Computer Science. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Meila S for excellent determination and effort in geography. 

Mrs S Russell would like to appreciate Amelia-Leigh S for excellent effort in geography. 

Miss S Foley would like to appreciate Hannah T for showing determination to succeed in RE lessons. 

 



 

 

 

 

Miss C Gregory would like to appreciate Harry W for always being respectful and polite during interventions with 
me. Well done Harry. 

Miss S Foley would like to appreciate Ethan W for showing determination to succeed in RE lessons. 

Mr J Walshaw would like to appreciate Ethan W for their hard work and excellent application in PE. Well done. 

Mrs S Russell would like to appreciate Nicholas W for excellent effort in geography. 

Miss S Foley would like to appreciate Alfie W for showing determination to succeed in Spanish lessons. 

Mr J Walshaw would like to appreciate Alfie W for their hard work and excellent application in PE. Well done. 

  



 

 

 

 

Appreciations Friday 10 November 2023 

Year 8 

Mrs S Russell would like to appreciate Paisley B for excellent effort in computer science. 

Miss S Foley would like to appreciate Lucy B for showing determination to succeed in Spanish lessons. 

Miss E Sandland would like to appreciate Abbie B for outstanding effort in Geography. 

Mrs R Lewis would like to appreciate Heidi C for excellent effort in science. 

Miss E Sandland would like to appreciate Sophie C for outstanding effort in Geography. 

Miss E Sandland would like to appreciate Aaron C for outstanding effort in Geography. 

Miss S Foley would like to appreciate Aaron C for showing determination to succeed in Spanish lessons. 

Miss E Sandland would like to appreciate Scarlett C for outstanding effort in Geography. 

Miss S Foley would like to appreciate Filip C for showing determination to succeed in Spanish lessons. 

Miss E Sandland would like to appreciate Thomas D for outstanding effort in Geography. 

Mrs R Lewis would like to appreciate Ruby-Leigh F for excellent effort in science. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Louis F for excellent determination and effort in geography. 

Mrs S Russell would like to appreciate Shay F for always being helpful during DEAR and always showing respect. 

Miss E Sandland would like to appreciate Shay F for outstanding effort in Geography. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Kora-Lea G for excellent determination and effort in geography. 

Mr R Al-Ghailani would like to appreciate Neha G for always being an excellent role both in class and around school. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Eirini G for excellent determination and effort in geography. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Julia G for excellent determination and effort in geography. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate John-Paul H for excellent determination and effort in geography. 

Miss S Foley would like to appreciate Ellis H for showing determination to succeed in Spanish lessons. 

Mrs S Russell would like to appreciate Summer J for always being helpful during DEAR and always showing respect. 

Mrs S Russell would like to appreciate James L for always being helpful during DEAR and always showing respect. 

Mr J Walshaw would like to appreciate Szymon M for their hard work and excellent application in PE. Well done. 

Mrs S Russell would like to appreciate Hannah O for excellent effort in computer science. 

Mr J Walshaw would like to appreciate Jacob P for their hard work and excellent application in PE. Well done. 

Mrs S Russell would like to appreciate Rylan R for excellent effort in computer science. 

Mr J Walshaw would like to appreciate Kyle R for their hard work and excellent application in PE. Well done. 

Mrs R Lewis would like to appreciate Jessica R for excellent effort in science. 

Mrs R Lewis would like to appreciate Leighton S for excellent effort in science. 

Mrs S Russell would like to appreciate Francis S for excellent effort in computer science. 

Mr J Walshaw would like to appreciate Artur S for their hard work and excellent application in PE. Well done. 

Mrs S Russell would like to appreciate Luke T for excellent effort in computer science. 

Mrs R Lewis would like to appreciate Liliana Z for excellent effort in science. 

Mrs R Lewis would like to appreciate Ricards Z for excellent effort in science. 

Mr J Walshaw would like to appreciate Mutsa Z for their hard work and excellent application in PE. Well done. 

  



 

 

 

 

Appreciations Friday 10 November 2023 

Year 9 

Miss C Moore would like to appreciate David A for fantastic determination in History. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Kevin B for excellent determination and effort in geography. 

Miss E Sandland would like to appreciate Ershyad B for outstanding effort in Geography. 

Mrs H Zeqaj would like to appreciate Ethan C for wonderful focus and application of knowledge throughout our 
study of 'The Werewolf'. 

Miss S Foley would like to appreciate Esther E for showing determination to succeed in Spanish lessons. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Joe E for excellent determination and effort in geography. 

Mrs H Zeqaj would like to appreciate Divina E for wonderful focus and application of knowledge throughout our 
study of 'The Werewolf'. 

Miss S Foley would like to appreciate Oliver H for showing determination to succeed in Spanish lessons. 

Mrs H Zeqaj would like to appreciate Oliver H for wonderful focus and application of knowledge throughout our 
study of 'The Werewolf'. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Ellie-Mae H for excellent determination and effort in geography. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Charlie L for excellent determination and effort in geography. 

Mrs H Zeqaj would like to appreciate Barney N for wonderful focus and application of knowledge throughout our 
study of 'The Werewolf'. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Maya W for excellent determination and effort in geography. 

Mrs H Zeqaj would like to appreciate Sagid Y for wonderful focus and application of knowledge throughout our 
study of 'The Werewolf'. 

  



 

 

 

 

Appreciations Friday 10 November 2023 

Year 10 

Mrs H Zeqaj would like to appreciate Matthew A for wonderful focus and determination during our study of 
'Checking Out Me History'. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Mia B for excellent determination and effort during DEAR time. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Freya B for excellent determination and effort in geography. 

Mrs S Russell would like to appreciate Ali B for excellent start in their BTEC Enterprises controlled assessment. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Oliver C for excellent determination and effort during DEAR time. 

Miss S Foley would like to appreciate Abdullah C for showing determination to succeed in Spanish lessons. 

Miss E Sandland would like to appreciate Lucie C for outstanding effort in Geography. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Marcos D for excellent determination and effort during DEAR time. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Shay D for excellent determination and effort during DEAR time. 

Mr A Gallagher would like to appreciate George E for excellent effort in BTEC Enterprise. 

Mr B Ashcroft would like to appreciate George E for his exceptional effort during his RE studies. 

Miss C Gregory would like to appreciate Lucas E for always being polite and respectful when we meet on the 
corridor. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Emily F for excellent determination and effort in geography. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Augustas G for excellent determination and effort during DEAR time. 

Mrs H Zeqaj would like to appreciate Augustas G for wonderful focus and determination during our study of 
'Checking Out Me History'. 

Miss E Sandland would like to appreciate Leighton G for outstanding effort in Geography. 

Mr B Ashcroft would like to appreciate Leighton G for his excellent DIRT work during RE. Well done and keep up 
the great work. 

Mr A Gallagher would like to appreciate Charlie H for excellent effort in BTEC DIT. 

Mr A Gallagher would like to appreciate Ella H for excellent effort in BTEC Enterprise. 

Mrs S Russell would like to appreciate Caitlyn H for excellent start in their BTEC Enterprises controlled assessment. 

Mrs S Russell would like to appreciate Jessica H for excellent start in their BTEC Enterprises controlled assessment. 

Mr A Gallagher would like to appreciate Aden J for excellent effort in BTEC DIT. 

Mrs S Russell would like to appreciate Caitlin K for excellent start in their BTEC Enterprises controlled assessment. 

Miss S Foley would like to appreciate Jessie-Jo L for showing determination to succeed in Spanish lessons. 

Mrs H Zeqaj would like to appreciate Faye L for wonderful focus and determination during our study of 'Checking 
Out Me History'. 

Mr A Gallagher would like to appreciate Sonnie L for excellent effort in BTEC Enterprise. 

Mrs K Byrne would like to appreciate Libby L for going the extra mile in catering class on Wednesday and helping 
others out. Thank you. 

Mr B Ashcroft would like to appreciate Brandan M for his hard work, grit and determination in RE. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Alfie M for excellent determination and effort in geography. 

Mrs S Russell would like to appreciate Alfie M for excellent start in their BTEC Enterprises controlled assessment. 

Mr A Gallagher would like to appreciate Teddy N for excellent effort in BTEC Enterprise. 

Mrs K Byrne would like to appreciate Leah P for going the extra mile in catering class on Wednesday and helping 
others out. Thank you. 



 

 

 

 

 

Mrs K Byrne would like to appreciate Lorien R for going the extra mile in catering class on Wednesday and helping 
others out. Thank you. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Louise S for excellent determination and effort in geography. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Eva S for excellent determination and effort in geography. 

Mrs S Russell would like to appreciate Eva S for excellent start in their BTEC Enterprises controlled assessment. 

Mr J Ollerton would like to appreciate Adam S for brilliance in Sociology. 

Mr A Gallagher would like to appreciate Sarah T for excellent effort in BTEC Enterprise. 

Mrs S Russell would like to appreciate Nikita T for excellent start in their BTEC Enterprises controlled assessment. 

Mrs K Byrne would like to appreciate Liene Z for going the extra mile in catering class on Wednesday and helping 
others out. Thank you. 

  



 

 

 

 

Appreciations Friday 10 November 2023 

Year 11 

Mr A Gallagher would like to appreciate Olivia B for excellent effort in BTEC Enterprise. 

Mrs H Zeqaj would like to appreciate Harry C for wonderful contributions to lesson. 

Mrs S Russell would like to appreciate Ryan C for excellent effort and determination in completing their BTEC 
enterprise controlled assessment. 

Miss S Foley would like to appreciate Keigan C for showing determination to succeed in Spanish lessons. 

Mrs S Russell would like to appreciate Kayden D for excellent effort and determination in completing their BTEC 
enterprise controlled assessment. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Ava E for excellent determination and effort in geography. 

Mrs H Zeqaj would like to appreciate Ruby E for wonderful contributions to lesson. 

Mr A Gallagher would like to appreciate Guillermo E for excellent effort in BTEC Enterprise. 

Mrs S Russell would like to appreciate Viesturs K for excellent effort and determination on their controlled 
assessment in BTEC Enterprise. 

Miss S Foley would like to appreciate Blake L for showing determination to succeed in Spanish lessons. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Georgia M for excellent determination and effort in geography. 

Mrs H Zeqaj would like to appreciate Harry M for wonderful contributions to lesson. 

Miss S Ambrose would like to appreciate Jamie M for consistent excellence in History lessons. Always ready to learn 
and fantastic work ethic. 

Mr A Gallagher would like to appreciate Jamie M for excellent effort in BTEC Enterprise. 

Mrs S Russell would like to appreciate Stas M for excellent effort and determination on their controlled assessment 
in BTEC Enterprise. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Maddison M for excellent determination and effort in geography. 

Mr A Gallagher would like to appreciate Andrew O for excellent effort in BTEC Enterprise. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Ruby O for excellent determination and effort in geography. 

Miss S Foley would like to appreciate Ruby O for showing determination to succeed in Spanish lessons. 

Mrs S Russell would like to appreciate Kieran P for excellent effort and determination in completing their BTEC 
enterprise controlled assessment. 

Miss S Foley would like to appreciate Goda S for showing determination to succeed in Spanish lessons. 

Mr J Brennan would like to appreciate Rhys T for excellent determination and effort in geography. 

Mr A Gallagher would like to appreciate Ewan T for excellent effort in BTEC Enterprise. 

Mr A Gallagher would like to appreciate Harrison T for excellent effort in BTEC Enterprise. 

Mrs H Zeqaj would like to appreciate Chinyere U for wonderful contributions to lesson. 

 

 


